The Clinton Law Firm, LLC

The Clinton Law Firm, LLC 111 W Washington Street Suite 1437 Chicago, IL 60602 United States 312-357-1515

Paul R. Dulberg 4606 Hayden Court McHenry, IL 60051

Balance \$0.00 **Invoice** # 00412

Invoice Date December 20, 2019

Payment Terms

Due Date

Dulberg v. Law Offices of Thomas Popovich, PC and Hans Mast

Time Entries

Date	EE	Activity	Description	Rate	Hours	Line Total
02/18/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Draft and file motion for default; draft discovery requests	\$0.00	1.8	\$0.00
02/20/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Call with opposing counsel re answer and court	\$0.00	0.4	\$0.00
02/25/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Court appearance on status and motion for default	\$0.00	3.5	\$0.00
02/26/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Email client re discovery ad answer	\$0.00	0.1	\$0.00
03/13/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Review Complaint/Answer: email with client	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00
03/14/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Respond to client emails.	\$0.00	0.3	\$0.00
03/25/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Draft responses to Affirmative Defenses	\$0.00	0.3	\$0.00
04/04/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Review Affirmative Defenses and send again to the client	\$0.00	0.3	\$0.00
04/08/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Finalize and file Affirmative Defenses	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00
04/18/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Draft discovery responses	\$0.00	2.0	\$0.00
05/28/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Prepare document production including redaction, call with Dulberg, Revise Discovery Answers and email client	\$0.00	4.8	\$0.00
05/29/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Draft Discovery responses, call with George Flynn	\$0.00	3.0	\$0.00
05/30/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Court appearance in McHenry	\$0.00	3.0	\$0.00
07/02/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Update discovery responses; send to client; email re discovery to opposing counsel	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00
07/23/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Review client email re discovery	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00
07/29/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Review client notes and email re discovery	\$0.00	0.3	\$0.00
07/31/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Modify discovery responses; email to client	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00

09/05/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Court appearance in McHenry, travel to and from Court, Meet with Mr. Dulberg, meet with opposing counsel re 201(k) notes on court and meetings	\$0.00	5.0	\$0.00
10/23/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Review discovery, email client	\$0.00	0.5	\$0.00
10/28/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Review Emil from Dulberg and discovery responses, discuss with EXC Jr.	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00
10/30/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Follow up with George Flynn re discovery	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00
11/04/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Review Defendant's discovery; email to Paul Dulberg; legal research re punitive damages	\$0.00	1.5	\$0.00
11/04/2019	JCM	Legal Services	Court call appearance by phone, review client email and revise discovery	\$0.00	2.3	\$0.00
11/25/2019	JCM	Legal Services	Review documents produced and create spreadsheet of documents	\$0.00	1.0	\$0.00
12/02/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Telephone call with Joseph Olson. He will send whatever information he may have	\$0.00	0.3	\$0.00
12/03/2019	EC	Legal Services	Confer wtih JCW re status of case	\$0.00	0.3	\$0.00
12/06/2019	JCW	Legal Services	Confer with EXC Jr re status of case, next steps	\$0.00	0.3	\$0.00

Expenses

Date	EE	Activity	Description	Cost	Quantity	Line Total
10/30/2019	EC	Filing Fees	Court call Service Fee	\$65.00	1.0	\$65.00
11/04/2019	EC	Court Appearance	Court Call Service Fee	\$65.00	1.0	\$65.00

Expense Total: \$130.00

38.0

\$0.00

Time Entry Sub-Total: \$0.00

Expense Sub-Total: \$130.00

Sub-Total: \$130.00

Total: \$130.00

Amount Paid: \$130.00

Balance Due: \$0.00

Totals:

Payment History

Activity	Date	Payment Method	Amount	Responsible User	Deposited Into
Payment Received	Dec 20, 2019	Trust	\$130.00	Edward Clinton, Jr. (Attorney)	Operating Account

Account Summary

Paul R. Dulberg's Trust History

Balance As Of 12/20/2019: \$4,870.00

Date	Related To	Details	Amount	Balance
12/20/2019	00412	Payment from trust	-\$130.00	\$4,870.00
11/07/2018		Trust deposit	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00