
From: Julia WIlliams juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Subject: Fwd: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178

Date: February 10, 2020 at 3:10 PM
To: Paul Dulberg paul_dulberg@comcast.net
Cc: Mary Winch marywinch@clintonlaw.net, Ed Clinton ed@clintonlaw.net

Paul, 

Email #5  from Joe Olsen

Julia Williams
Of Counsel
The Clinton Law Firm
111 W. Washington, Ste. 1437
Chicago, IL 60602
P:312.357.1515
F: 312.201.0737
juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net

This message may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete the email and notify the sender 
immediately. 

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>
Subject: Fwd: Re: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178
Date: December 2, 2019 at 2:05:19 PM CST
To: juliawilliams@clintonlaw.net
Reply-To: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net>

Joseph D. Olsen - Yalden, Olsen & Willette
838 North Main Street, Rockford, IL 61103-6906
(815) 965-8635 | Fax (815) 965-4573 | jolsenlaw@comcast.net

We have moved!  Our new address is noted above.  Our phone, fax, and email addresses will remain  the same.  Thank  
you.

---------- Original Message ---------- 
From: Joe Olsen <jolsenlaw@comcast.net> 
To: Randy Baudin II <randybaudin2@gmail.com> 
Cc: jolsenlaw <jolsenlaw@comcast.net> 
Date: December 13, 2016 at 2:33 PM 
Subject: Re: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178 

Randy-

Just a follow up to our conf. this afternoon, where you advised the results of the binding mediation;

First off, thank you. 

Difficult having a Ch. 7 Trustee hovering around your file. I appreciate your professionalism and cooperation;

Secondly, Re medical liens,  I reviewed what I had. I came across 1 lien claim, that from U.S. Physical Therapy, Inc., it looks 
pretty defective. Did you or one of the prior attys. on file ever get notice from them? From any other lien claimant? If you have any 
such information, could you send me a complete copy of whatever it is you have?

Third, Re your compensation (most important), do we have to worry about any of the debtor's  previous atty's possible claim for 
lien?

If so, can you give me whatever you have re same? The quickest way to get you paid, is if you can provide me w/ the equivalent 
of a settlement statement which would show how much is owed under the contingent fee contract, plus any costs/expenses  
claimed by you.

If there is any other claim by any other party to the settlement proceeds, please let me know;

As soon as I get the "settlement statement" I'll file w/ court to get it approved. It's a 21 day notice.
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Can you let me know when you expect to receive the settlement funds? Again, you must turn over the gross proceeds to me.

Thanks again.

Joseph D. Olsen
Yalden, Olsen & Willette
1318 East State Street
Rockford, IL 61104
(815)965-8635
Fax (815)965-4573

On October 31, 2016 at 10:50 AM Randy Baudin II <randybaudin2@gmail.com> wrote: 

You can good ahead sign it.  Thank you so much.

On Mon, Oct 31, 2016 at 10:41 AM, < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> wrote: 

Randy- 
The Court authorized your appointment this morning, as well as 
entry into that "Binding Mediation Agreement";
Do you want the debtor to /s/ the form, or me as trustee?
Let me know, thanks.

From: "Randy Baudin II" < randybaudin2@gmail.com> 
To: "jolsenlaw" < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> 
Sent: Monday, September 26, 2016 2:09:00 PM 
Subject: Re: Paul Dulberg 14-83578 & 12LA178 

Any luck on appointing us as attorneys on this case yet?

Thanks, 
Randy

On Fri, Sep 16, 2016 at 11:24 AM, < jolsenlaw@comcast.net> 
wrote: 

Randy- 
Nice talking w/ you today, below is contact info.
Thanks.

Joseph D. Olsen 
Yalden, Olsen & Willette 
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Yalden, Olsen & Willette 
1318 East State Street 
Rockford, IL  61104 
(815)965-8635 
Fax (815)965-4573 

-- 

 W. Randal Baudin II's Linkedin Profile
                           Cell 815.814.2193 
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 W. Randal Baudin II's Linkedin Profile
                           Cell 815.814.2193
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