
Date : 6/23/2022 8:07:12 AM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Law Office Of Alphonse Talarico" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" , "Tom Kost" 
Subject : Re: Dulberg v. Popovich 17 LA 377 Invoice from Expert Alan R. Kravets
Dear Mr Talarico,

Check Number 1926 made out to you in the amount of $1,650.00 has been mailed to your office.

Thank you,
Paul

On Jun 23, 2022, at 7:48 AM, Alphonse Talarico 
<contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com> wrote:

Please to me.

From: Paul Dulberg <Paul_Dulberg@comcast.net>
Sent: Thursday, June 23, 2022 6:29 AM
To: Alphonse Talarico <contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com>
Subject: Re: Dulberg v. Popovich 17 LA 377 Invoice from Expert Alan R. Kravets
 
Dear Mr Talarico,

Do you want the check made out to you or Mr Kravits?

Do I mail it to you or Mr Kravits at the address listed on the invoices?

Please advise and I will cut a check ASAP.

Thank You,
Paul

> On Jun 22, 2022, at 5:09 PM, Alphonse Talarico 
<contact@lawofficeofalphonsetalarico.com> wrote:
> 
> <Talarico Invoice Feb 1 from Alan Kravets Consulting Expert.jpeg>
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