Date : 3/1/2023 2:29:21 PM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : "CircuitClerk-MB"

Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] Records request for case 121LA326
Attachment : 2023-03-01_Payment Confirmation.pdf; ATT00002.bin;
Dear Patty,

Please find the attached receipt for payment.

Thank you,
Paul




Payment Confirmation

lof1

about:blank
M AllPaid
a pq I 7820 Innovation Boulevard Suite 250
— Indianapolis,IN 46278
' 24hr. Customer Service #: 888-604-7888
Online Payments Payment Confirmation (Ref #: 37843229)
PLC: Mc Henry County Circuit Court Clerk Date: 03/01/2023 15:25 EST
6650 2200 North Seminary Avenue
Woodstock, lllinois 60098
For: Online Payments
TRANSACTION INFORMATION
Name: Paul Dulberg Transaction Reference #: 37843229
Case #: 20121a000326 Transaction Date/Time: 03/01/2023 15:25 EST
Address: 4606 Hayden Ct
Email Address: Pdulberg@icloud.com
BILLING INFORMATION
Name: Paul R Dulberg
Address: 4606 Hayden Ct.
City, State Zip: Mchenry, 1l 60051
Phone #: (847)497-4250
Card #: XXXX-XXXX-XXXX-0410
PAYMENT INFORMATION
Approval #: 042549
Payment Amount: $50.50
Service Fee: $1.75
Total Amount: $52.25
The service fee is not refundable.
ATTENTION CARDHOLDER
If you have questions about the processing of your payment, please call AllPaid at 888-604-7888.
Thank you for using AllPaid
© 2007 - 2023 AllPaid, Inc. Form #: EUR

3/1/23,2:26 PM






On Mar 1, 2023, at 2:08 PM, CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov> wrote:

*** THIS IS FOR ELECTRONIC COPIES ONLY ***
 
Please reference EXACTLY this Case # 2012LA000326
 
The total cost for your request will be $50.50.  To submit payment, follow the instructions for payment options on the link below:
 
https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/cyg/plc/6650
 
Upon receipt of payment, I will forward the requested document in the order that they came in as time allows.
 
Thank you,
Patty
Administrative Specialist
McHenry County Circuit Clerk
circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov
 
 
 
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2023 2:03 PM
To: CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Records request for case 12LA326


 
Dear Patty,

 

I’ll take the whole file for $50.50 in PDF form please.
 

Please send a link for payment.

 

Thank you,

Paul



On Mar 1, 2023, at 1:59 PM, CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov> wrote:

 
The entire file is $50.50. If you want just court orders you will need to provide a list of the dates they were filed.

 

 

Patty          

Administrative Specialist

McHenry County Circuit Clerk

circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov

 

 

 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, March 1, 2023 10:36 AM
To: McHenry County Circuit Clerk <mchenrycircuitclerk@circuitclerkofmchenrycounty.org>; CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Records request for case 12LA326



 

Dear Circuit Clerk,

 


I am requesting and would like to purchase all file stamped court orders in PDF form for case 12LA326.


 


Please provide the link for payment your response.


 


 


Separately, I am also requesting a quote on the cost for all documents for case 12LA326.


 


 


Thank you in advance for your help with this matter.


 


Sincerely,


Paul


 


Paul Dulberg


4606 Hayden Ct.


McHenry, IL. 60051


 


847-497-4250


pdulberg@icloud.com


 


 


		CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com
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