
Date : 2/23/2023 1:25:06 PM
From : "Kristine Ferru" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 
3/15/2021
 
Hi Mr. Dulberg,
 
An estimate for the Report of Proceedings as referenced above is $220.  I can have it complete within a 
week.  I will send you an invoice for the deposit, which is $110.  Please let me know if you have any 
questions.
 
Thank you,
Kristine

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 4:02 PM
To: Kristine Ferru <KLFerru@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 3/15/2021
 
Dear Kristine Ferru,
 
I am requesting a expedited certified PDF copy of a Report of Proceedings for 3/15/2021 in case number 
17LA377.
 
I don’t know if you have previously produced this as I cannot find it in our previous communications and 
do not seem to have a copy.
 
I am willing to pay for any fees and expedited costs incurred to produce the 3/15/2021 report of 
proceeding quickly. 
 
Please advise.
 
Thank You,
Paul
 
847-497-4250
pdulberg@icloud.com

Begin forwarded message:
 
From: Heather Hartwig <HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 
17LA377 - 3/15/2021
Date: February 22, 2023 at 3:34:30 PM CST
To: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>

mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com
mailto:HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov
mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com


 
Mr. Dulberg,
 
In the last email I sent you, I put the date you first requested.  I meant to say that Kristine 
Ferru is the court reporter responsible for the date of 3/15/21 for the case of 17 LA 377.
 
 
Sincerely,
 
Heather Voska Hartwig
 
 

From: Heather Hartwig 
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 3:29 PM
To: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 3/15/2021
 
Dear Mr. Dulberg,
 
The court reporter responsible for preparing a transcript from a hearing on 3/5/21 in case 
17 LA 377 is Kristine Ferru.  Kristine’s email isKLFerru@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov.  
 Kristine’s number is 815-334-4370.
 
Sincerely,
 
Heather Voska Hartwig
Official Court Reporter
McHenry County, Il
815-334-4347
 
 
 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 2:05 PM
To: Heather Hartwig <HVHartwig@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Expedited Request - Report of Proceedings - 17LA377 - 3/15/2021
 
Dear Heather Hartwig,
 
After my confusion over the last request I hate to ask this but in the past few minutes it 
has come to my attention that I do not have a report of proceeding for March 15, 2021.
 
Yes, this time we are sure that court occurred on March 15, 2021 but are unsure if the 
court reporter has already produced a report of proceeding.
 
I am willing to pay for all fees associated with producing an expedited report of proceeding 
in PDF form.
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Please advise.
 

Thank you, 
Paul
 

847-497-4250
pdulberg@icloud.com

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not 
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the 

content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email 

was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the 
helpdesk at extension 4828.
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