
Date : 10/27/2022 5:03:52 AM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Jean Nerbo" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" , "Alphonse Talarico" 
Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] Final invoice
Attachment : 2022-10-26_Notification Your 3250 to Jean Nerbo was sent.pdf; 
ATT00002.bin; 

Dear Jean Nerbo,

Please find the attached PDF of an email from my bank showing $32.50 was sent to you and is 
not pending.

If you have not received it by now please let me know.

Thanks, 
Paul





From: Crystal Lake Bank & Trust ZelleAlerts@communitybanking.crystallakebank.com
Subject: Notification - Your $32.50 to Jean Nerbo was sent


Date: October 26, 2022 at 10:25 AM
To: pdulberg@comcast.net


together with


Jean Nerbo


JN
You've successfully sent $32.50 to Jean


Nerbo


17LA377 10-13-2022 Report of Proceeding


Zelle is not responsible for the content of the personal message. Zelle cannot protect
against the receipt of material in the personal message that may be offensive to
individuals receiving or viewing the personal message. The personal message is the
viewpoint of the sender and is not endorsed or supported by Zelle.


Privacy and Security:
Your trust and security are our highest priorities. Any information you share with us is
confidential and secure.


Contact Us:
If you have questions, please do not reply to this message.
Crystal Lake Bank & Trust Company, N.A. customers can sign on at
http://www.wintrust.com/Zelle


MemberID (54786915)
AlertID (2975877739)
ReferenceID (577869158)
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mailto:TrustZelleAlerts@communitybanking.crystallakebank.com
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On Oct 26, 2022, at 11:57 AM, Jean Nerbo <JXNerbo@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

Hi.  I received payment.  It’s pending still now, so once through I’ll send pdf transcript.
 
From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 10:28 AM
To: Jean Nerbo <JXNerbo@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Final invoice


 
Dear Jean Nerbo,

 

Please find the attached screenshot of the payment receipt.

 

Thank You,

 

Paul

 

<image002.png>



On Oct 26, 2022, at 9:34 AM, Jean Nerbo <JXNerbo@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:

 
Mr. Dulberg, the transcript is completed.  Attached is my final invoice for Dulberg v Mast transcript taken on October 13, 2022.  Thank you.  Jean Nerbo, official court reporter, 22nd Judicial Circuit

<FINAL INVOICE DULBERG.pdf>




 
		CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent frompdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.












