
Date : 5/20/2022 4:42:06 PM
From : "Stacey Collins" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Invoice 2020-102 from Stacey A. Collins
Attachment : 12 12 14 R201(TAM)__12 LA 178_Amended Title Page.pdf; image001.jpg; 
 
Mr. Dulberg,
 
I have corrected the date on the title page of the December 12, 2014, Report of Proceedings in case 12 
LA 178.  I have filed same with the circuit clerk’s office.  I have attached a correct PDF for your records.  
Thank you for bringing the incorrect date to my attention.
 
Regarding my license number on the certification page, the Administrative Regulations for Court 
Reporting Services in the Illinois Courts have now differentiated the procedure regarding certification of 
transcripts from electronic recording and certification from stenographic notes.  I am in compliance with 
that regulation.  My license number is 084-002377 should you need to verify my licensure for any 
reason.  The absence of my license number on the certification page does not in any way render the 
certification invalid.  
 
 
Stacey A. Collins
Official Court Reporter
22nd Judicial Circuit
Woodstock, IL 
 
 

 
LEGAL CONFIDENTIAL: The information in this e-mail and in any attachment contains information which is legally 

privileged. It is intended only for the attention and use of the named recipient. If you are not the intended recipient, you are not 
authorized to retain, disclose, copy or distribute the message and/or any of its attachments. If you received this e-mail in error, 

please notify Stacey A. Collins, CSR, and delete this message.
 
 
 
 
 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Friday, May 20, 2022 1:41 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Cc: Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Invoice 2020-102 from Stacey A. Collins
 

http://www.google.com/imgres?imgurl=http://www.co.mchenry.il.us/departments/circuitclerk/PublishingImages/22Seal.png&imgrefurl=http://www.co.mchenry.il.us/departments/circuitclerk&usg=__gsdGw1CXgpbgBnn_pRqEAxUzI5w=&h=250&w=250&sz=82&hl=en&start=13&itbs=1&tbnid=JX4yH79y7D1FLM:&tbnh=111&tbnw=111&prev=/images?q=seal+of+McHenry+County&hl=en&gbv=2&tbs=isch:1


Dear Stacy Collins, 
 
Back on 01/11/2022 you provided me with 2 reports of proceedings for January 3, 2014 and December 
12, 2014  for case number 12LA178 and named the files you provided "01 03 14 R201(TAM)__12 LA 
178.pdf" and "12 12 14 R201(TAM)__12 LA 178.pdf” respectively.
 
Both reports of proceedings were stamped by the circuit clerk on 1/11/2022 and named "CC-Civil - 
12LA000178 - 1_11_2022 -  - - REOP -  - (6).pdf” and "CC-Civil - 12LA000178 - 1_11_2022 -  - - REOP -  - 
(5).pdf” respectively.
 
The issue I have is the Report of proceeding you sent me named, "12 12 14 R201(TAM)__12 LA 178.pdf” 
and the Report of Proceeding named "CC-Civil - 12LA000178 - 1_11_2022 -  - - REOP -  - (5).pdf” stamped 
by the circuit clerk appear to have the date of January 3, 2014 on the cover pages and I believe it should 
be December 12, 2014.
 
I have attached all the files listed above for you to review.
 
Please advise how we may get the date corrected on the cover page, refiled with the circuit clerk and an 
amended PDF file sent to myself.
 
Also, It would be appreciated if you could also provide your license number on the certification page in 
the amended version.
 
Thank you in advance for your help with this matter.
 
Sincerely,
Paul
 
Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
pdulberg@icloud.com
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051
 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click 
links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 

safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was 

actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk 
at extension 4828.

 

mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com
mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com


On Jan 11, 2022, at 8:45 AM, Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> 
wrote:
 
The January 3, 2014, and December 12, 2014, PDF reports of Proceedings in case 12 LA 178 
are attached.
 

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
Sent: Monday, January 10, 2022 4:41 PM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Invoice 2020-102 from Stacey A. Collins
 
Attached is the payment receipt 
 
Thank You,
Paul

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not 
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the 

content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email 

was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the 
helpdesk at extension 4828.

 
 

On Jan 10, 2022, at 3:08 PM, Stacey A. Collins <mailer@waveapps.com> 
wrote:
 

Stacey A. Collins

Invoice for $37.50 due by Jan 10, 2022

Review & Pay 
 

mailto:SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov
mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com
mailto:SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov
mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com
mailto:mailer@waveapps.com
https://urldefense.com/v3/__https:/click.pstmrk.it/2sm/link.waveapps.com*2F33cnzu-34dpq3/2TEcqigN/oawo/S-M3QUfpHM/QXJJbnZvaWNlRGVmYXVsdEVtYWls__;JQ!!Aql9viJT!SmJ-PlPSjnB6chgqAQQVxSS_09HUcPEo88Fj-RfI_7oCNW4ySP8teejKJm_qF49YXl5WS4jRvGopUvhTsq1HxanNmA9orH22lypH$


   Bank Payment (ACH)
 

Invoice 2020-102
View Invoice

Stacey A. Collins
Phone: 815 334 4378

© 2010-2022 Wave Financial Inc. All Rights Reserved. Privacy Policy • Terms of Use

 
<01 03 14 R201(TAM)__12 LA 178.pdf><12 12 14 R201(TAM)__12 LA 178.pdf>

 

https://urldefense.com/v3/__https:/click.pstmrk.it/2sm/link.waveapps.com*2F33cnzu-34dpq3/2TEcqigN/oawo/S-M3QUfpHM/QXJJbnZvaWNlRGVmYXVsdEVtYWls__;JQ!!Aql9viJT!SmJ-PlPSjnB6chgqAQQVxSS_09HUcPEo88Fj-RfI_7oCNW4ySP8teejKJm_qF49YXl5WS4jRvGopUvhTsq1HxanNmA9orH22lypH$
https://urldefense.com/v3/__https:/click.pstmrk.it/2sm/my.waveapps.com*2Fprivacy*2F/2jEcqigN/oawo/dmsNYxT-wQ/QXJJbnZvaWNlRGVmYXVsdEVtYWls__;JSU!!Aql9viJT!SmJ-PlPSjnB6chgqAQQVxSS_09HUcPEo88Fj-RfI_7oCNW4ySP8teejKJm_qF49YXl5WS4jRvGopUvhTsq1HxanNmA9orPsRXUvx$
https://urldefense.com/v3/__https:/click.pstmrk.it/2sm/my.waveapps.com*2Fterms*2F/2zEcqigN/oawo/olElhYZ6lA/QXJJbnZvaWNlRGVmYXVsdEVtYWls__;JSU!!Aql9viJT!SmJ-PlPSjnB6chgqAQQVxSS_09HUcPEo88Fj-RfI_7oCNW4ySP8teejKJm_qF49YXl5WS4jRvGopUvhTsq1HxanNmA9orMTHTAMU$
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AMENDED TITLE PAGE
1


STATE OF ILLINOIS )
   ) SS:  


COUNTY OF MCHENRY )


IN THE TWENTY-SECOND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
MCHENRY COUNTY, ILLINOIS


PAUL DULBERG, 


Plaintiff,


vs.  


DAVID GAGNON, Individually, 
and as Agent of CAROLINE 
MCGUIRE and BILL MCGUIRE and 
CAROLINE MCGUIRE and BILL 
MCGUIRE, Individually, 


Defendants.


)
)
)  
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)


 No. 12 LA 178


ELECTRONICALLY RECORDED Report of 


Proceedings had in the above-entitled cause before 


The Honorable Thomas A. Meyer, Judge of the Circuit 


Court of McHenry County, Illinois, on the 12th day of 


December, 2014, in the Michael J. Sullivan Judicial 


Center, Woodstock, Illinois.


APPEARANCES:


(NO APPEARANCES GIVEN.)
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ATTORNEY1:  Then on 201, line 17, Dulberg. 


ATTORNEY2:  Good morning, Your Honor.  


ATTORNEY1:  Defense counsel is having it reviewed.  


We had it kicked last time, but I think he wanted a 


little bit more time to get the expert on -- 


ATTORNEY2:  Yeah, I just haven't gotten my report 


back and -- 


THE COURT:  All right.  We're up for (f)(3) 


disclosures.  What are you asking?  


ATTORNEY1:  What's that?  


THE COURT:  What are you asking with respect to 


(f)(3) disclosures?  


ATTORNEY2:  We could close it in 45 days and then 


come back. 


THE COURT:  That going to be enough time?  


ATTORNEY2:  Yeah.  


THE COURT:  All right.  Put it out 45 days -- 


ATTORNEY1:  Well, we looked at February 4th, if 


that's okay.  


THE COURT:  That's fine.  That is fine.  We'll take 


it to February 4.  


ATTORNEY1:  And then I'll do the (f)(3).  
THE COURT:  Okay.  Thank you. 
ATTORNEY2:  Thank you, Judge. 


(Which was and is all of the evidence
offered at the hearing of said cause
this date.) 







1


2


3


4


5


6


7


8


9


10


11


12


13


14


15


16


17


18


19


20


21


22


23


24


3


STATE OF ILLINOIS )
) SS:


COUNTY OF MCHENRY )


I, Stacey A. Collins, an Official Court 


Reporter of the 22nd Judicial Circuit of Illinois, do 


hereby certify the foregoing to be a true and accurate 


Amended Title Page and transcription to the best of my 


ability and based on the quality of the recording of all 


the proceedings heard on the electronic recording system 


in the above-entitled cause.


                              


Stacey A. Collins, CSR
Official Court Reporter
 









