
Date : 3/24/2022 4:51:42 PM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : "Judy Carlson" 
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Re: [EXTERNAL] Request for report of proceedings for Case No. 17LA000377 
DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET AL
Attachment : 2022-03-24_17LA377_Wave • Judy Carlson, CSR •.pdf; ATT00002.txt; 
 
Dear Judy Carlson,

Please find the attached PDF of the payment receipt.

I will try and figure out the date issues you mentioned in the morning.

Thank you,
Paul

Paul Dulberg 
847-497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct. 
McHenry, IL. 60051





Back to Invoice


Payment Receipt
Invoice #168


for Paul Dulberg
paid on March 24, 2022


Judy Carlson, CSR


2200 North Seminary Avenue


Room 355


Woodstock, Illinois 60098


United States


Tel: 815-334-4373


Payment for Invoice #168


Payment Amount: $60.00 USD


PAYMENT METHOD:  •••• 0410


Wave • Judy Carlson, CSR • https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1427160...


1 of 2 3/24/22, 4:48 PM



https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1427160887755572770/7164314B6F6D32694E6F584C725A5A4B385A795032345055436B6539537069

https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1427160887755572770/7164314B6F6D32694E6F584C725A5A4B385A795032345055436B6539537069





Thanks for your business. If this invoice was sent in error, please
contact jacarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov


Wave • Judy Carlson, CSR • https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/11066602/readonly/1427160...
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mailto:jacarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

mailto:jacarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv

https://waveapps.com/accept-invoice-payments-online?utm_campaign=Mar_03142019_powered-by-wave&utm_medium=wo-pw&utm_source=loops&utm_term=nv_nv_nv&utm_content=nv_invoice-receipt-page_icon-button_nv





> On Mar 24, 2022, at 3:41 PM, Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:
> 
> Good afternoon Mr. Dulberg,
> 
> In my haste in preparing the list, I had a typo for a date assigned to Maureen Urbanski.  It should have been 1-24-2020, which she is aware of.
> The date of 11-8-2021 which I assigned to Stacey should have been assigned to me.  So I have prepared that transcript.
> Also the date of 11-4-2019 was previously prepared by me for you.  So I will send you that transcript at no charge.
> 
> Sorry for the inconvenience.  The transcripts are complete and I will be sending you an invoice shortly.
> 
> Thank you,
> 
> Judy
> 
> -----Original Message-----
> From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
> Sent: Wednesday, March 23, 2022 11:01 AM
> To: Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
> Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Request for report of proceedings for Case No. 17LA000377 DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET AL
> 
> Dear Judy Carlson,
> 
> Thank you for creating the list.
> 
> I have reached out to each court reporter and submitted my request.
> 
> I will promptly take care of your invoice once you send it.
> 
> Again, thank you.
> 
> Paul
> 
> Paul Dulberg
> 847-497-4250
> Pdulberg@icloud.com
> 4606 Hayden Ct.
> McHenry, IL. 60051
> 
>> On Mar 22, 2022, at 3:40 PM, Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:
>> 
>> Good afternoon Mr. Dulberg,
>> 
>> I went through the entire docket and have attached a listing of the reporters responsible for the dates following their names and information.  I have marked which transcripts have been prepared so you can ask them to provide you with a copy of that also.  
>> Please order the transcripts from each court reporter so that they can make payment arrangements for the transcripts.
>> 
>> I will provide you with the two dates I have of June 14, 2021 and November 4, 2019.  Once I have completed the transcripts, I will send you an invoice for the amount due.
>> 
>> I hope this makes sense.  Also, ignore the blank page at the end of the attachment.
>> 
>> Please feel free to contact me if you need further assistance.
>> 
>> Thank you,
>> 
>> 
>> Judy Carlson, CSR
>> Official Court Reporter
>> CRS Supervisor
>> 2200 N. Seminary Ave. Suite 355
>> Woodstock, IL 60098
>> (815) 334-4373
>> 
>> 
>> 
>> STATE OF ILLINOIS
>> CIRCUIT COURT
>> 22ND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
>> McHENRY COUNTY, ILLINOIS
>> 
>> 
>> CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:  This electronic message and all of its contents contain information from the 22nd Judicial Circuit which may be privileged, confidential or otherwise protected from disclosure.  The information is intended to be for the addressee(s) only.  If you are not an addressee, any disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the contents of this message, or any portion thereof, is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this electronic message in error, please notify us immediately at (815) 334-4385 and destroy the original message and all copies. 
>> 
>> 
>> 
>> -----Original Message-----
>> From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> 
>> Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2022 12:15 PM
>> To: Judy Carlson <JACarlson@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
>> Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for report of proceedings for Case No. 17LA000377 DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET AL
>> 
>> Dear Judy Carlson,
>> 
>> I have a large request for every single report of proceedings for Case No. 17LA000377 DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET AL.
>> 
>> What I need is a PDF copy of every transcript / report of proceeding for every court date and hearing held in Case No. 17LA000377 DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET AL signed by the court reporters.
>> 
>> I can supply a list of court dates but since this is a blanket request for all court dates I’m hoping that I don’t need to compile the list unless you need it.
>> 
>> I understand that I may have ordered a few of these individually in the past and am willing to pay for copies of the previously made reports again as long as they are certified and have the court reporters signatures.
>> 
>> I had an issue with a hard drive and am sending it out to get the information retrieved and don't know yet if the information is retrievable or if I will get the previously ordered reports back so I am just reordering everything so I have a complete record.
>> 
>> As usual I am willing to pay any expedited fees to get these as soon as I can.
>> 
>> Please advise the best way to go about ordering and/or reordering the transcripts / reports of proceeding for every single court event in Case No. 17LA000377 DULBERG, PAUL VS MAST, HANS, ET AL.
>> 
>> Thank you in advance for your help with this matter, Paul
>> 
>> Paul Dulberg
>> 847-497-4250
>> pdulberg@icloud.com
>> 4606 Hayden Ct.
>> McHenry, IL. 60051
>> 
>> CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
>> 
>> While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com
>> 
>> If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.
>> <17 LA 377 DULBERG REPORTER LISTING.docx>
> 
> CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
> 
> While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com
> 
> If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.



