
Date : 2/25/2022 2:46:49 PM
From : "CircuitClerk-MB" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] Request for Electronic Copies of Records Filed in Case 
Number 12LA000178 DULBERG, PAUL VS GAGNON, DAVID, ET AL
Attachment : 12LA000178.zip; 
 

Thank you for your payment! Attached please find copies of the documents you requested. 

Bridget
Lead Court Specialist
McHenry County Circuit Clerk
circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov

-----Original Message-----
From: CircuitClerk-MB 
Sent: Friday, February 25, 2022 1:37 PM
To: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Request for Electronic Copies of Records Filed in Case Number 12LA000178 
DULBERG, PAUL VS GAGNON, DAVID, ET AL

Please reference case #12LA000178

The total cost for your request will be $12.00.  To submit payment, follow the instructions for payment options on 
the link below:

https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/plc/6650

Thank you,

Bridget
Lead Court Specialist
McHenry County Circuit Clerk
circuitclerk@mchenrycountyil.gov

-----Original Message-----
From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com] 
Sent: Friday, February 25, 2022 12:33 PM
To: CircuitClerk-MB <CircuitClerk@mchenrycountyil.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for Electronic Copies of Records Filed in Case Number 12LA000178 DULBERG, 
PAUL VS GAGNON, DAVID, ET AL

Dear Circuit Clerk,

https://www.govpaynow.com/gps/user/plc/6650
mailto:pdulberg@icloud.com


I am requesting and would like to purchase a PDF of documents filed in Case Number 12LA000178    DULBERG, 
PAUL VS GAGNON, DAVID, ET AL.

Below is a detailed list:
12/12/2016 ORD ORDER
08/10/2016 ORD ORDER
07/21/2016 ORD ORDER
07/11/2016 ORD ORDER
06/13/2016 ORD ORDER
06/06/2016 MOT MOTION
06/06/2016 MOTB MOTION - BAR
06/06/2016 MOTCOT MOTION - CONTINUE
06/06/2016 NOTM NOTICE - MOTION
06/06/2016 NOTM NOTICE - MOTION
06/06/2016 NOTM NOTICE - MOTION
03/17/2016 ORD ORDER
02/11/2016 ORD ORDER
01/28/2016 ORD ORDER
11/06/2015 APE APPEARANCE
11/06/2015 ORD ORDER
11/03/2015 NOTF NOTICE - FILING
10/20/2015 ORD ORDER
09/08/2015 ORD ORDER 

Please advise the best way to go about paying for and receiving the documents listed above in PDF format.

I am willing to pay an expedited fee.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter, Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct. McHenry, IL 60051

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments 
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common 
spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.





12LA000178/12LA000178--2015-09-08--ORD_0080.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2015-10-20--ORD_0081.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2015-11-03--NOTF_0082.pdf

















12LA000178/12LA000178--2015-11-06--APE_0083.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-01-28--ORD_0085.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-02-11--ORD_0086.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-03-17--ORD_0087.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-06-06--MOT_0093.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-06-06--MOTB_0089.pdf























12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-06-06--MOTCOT_0091.pdf

















12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-06-06--NOTM_0088.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-06-06--NOTM_0090.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-06-06--NOTM_0092.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-06-13--ORD_0094.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-07-11--ORD_0095.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-07-21--ORD_0096.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-08-10--ORD_0097.pdf











12LA000178/12LA000178--2016-12-12--ORD_0098.pdf









