Date : 2/23/2022 2:01:51 PM

From : "Kristine Ferru"

To : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : RE: [EXTERNAL] Request for three Reports of Proceedings for 12LA178
DULBERG, PAUL VS GAGNON, DAVID, ET AL

Good afternoon, Mr. Dulberg,

An estimate of the cost to order the three transcripts would be between $140 to $150. I will send an invoice for a
deposit of $75. 1 can have them complete within a week. Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,

Kristine Ferru, CSR

Official Court Reporter

McHenry County Government Center
2200 N. Seminary Avenue, Room 355
Woodstock, IL 60098

(815) 334-4370

From: Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 22, 2022 4:40 PM

To: Kristine Ferru <KLFerru@?22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for three Reports of Proceedings for 12LA178 DULBERG, PAUL VS GAGNON,
DAVID, ET AL

Dear Kristine Ferru,

I have a request for three report of proceeding's for case number 12LA178 DULBERG, PAUL VS GAGNON,
DAVID, ET AL

What I need is a PDF copy of the transcript's / report of proceeding’s signed by the court reporter.
Below are the dates needed;

02/11/2016

11/06/2015

06/12/2015

Please advise the best way to go about paying for and receiving these Reports of Proceedings.

I am also willing to pay an expedited fee.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter, Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250

4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL. 60051

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.



While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are common. It is also a common
spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was actually sent from pdulberg@icloud.com

If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk at extension 4828.



