
Date : 11/15/2021 2:39:05 PM
From : "Paul Dulberg" 
To : MSUrbanski@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov
BCc : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Re: Request for Report of Proceedings February 25, 2019 Case 17LA377
 
Dear Maureen Urbanski,

I did not hear back on the report of proceeding request I sent last week.

Case number: 
17LA377

Date needed: 
February 25, 2019 

Please provide to me a link for payment.

Thank you in advance for your help with this matter,

Paul

Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL 60051
 

> On Nov 12, 2021, at 12:33 PM, Paul Dulberg <pdulberg@icloud.com> wrote:
> 
> Dear Maureen Urbanski,
> 
> I am requesting and would like to purchase a PDF copy of a Transcript or Report of Proceedings dated February 
25, 2019 for Case Number 17LA377.
> 
> Please advise on the cost plus a link to pay for the report.
> 
> Thank you in advance for your help with this matter, 
> Paul
> 
> Paul Dulberg
> 847-497-4250
> 4606 Hayden Ct.
> McHenry, IL 60051


