Date : 4/14/2021 11:49:22 AM

From : "Paul Dulberg"

To : sacollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

BCc : "Paul Dulberg"

Subject : Re: Invoice #2020-031 from Stacey A. Collins

Attachment : 2021-04-14_Wave * Stacey A. Collins *.pdf; ATT00002.bin;

Dear Stacy Collins,
Please find the attached PDF named "2021-04-14 Wave * Stacey A. Collins .pdf"
The attached PDF is a receipt of payment.

Thank you very much,
Paul

Paul Dulberg

4606 Hayden Ct
McHenry, IL. 60051
Phone: 847-497-4250
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Payment Receipt
Invoice #2020-031

for Paul Dulberg
paid on April 14, 2021

Stacey A. Collins
Official Court Reporter
2200 N. Seminary Avenue - Room 355
Woodstock, lllinois 60098
United States
Tel: 815 334 4378

Payment for Invoice #2020-031

Payment Amount: $85.00 USD

PAYMENT METHOD: (CRYSTAL LAKE BANK AND TRUST

Thanks for your business. If this invoice was sent in error,
contact sacollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov

C )

«ee 528)

please

4/14/21, 11:44 AM





Wave ¢ Stacey A. Collins ¢ https://accounting.waveapps.com/invoices/12836581/readonly/1177663...

2 of 2 4/14/21, 11:44 AM






On Apr 14, 2021, at 10:50 AM, Stacey A. Collins <mailer@waveapps.com> wrote:

						Stacey A. Collins




		

		Invoice for $85.00 due by Apr 14, 2021











								Review & Pay 


















				[image: ]   Bank Payment (ACH)










						

















				Invoice 2020-031



		View Invoice


		Stacey A. Collins
Phone: 815 334 4378
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