
Date : 4/5/2021 11:09:52 AM
From : "Stacey Collins" 
To : "Paul Dulberg" 
Subject : Re: 17 LA 377
 
Mr. Dulberg,
 
If you are agreeable, I would be willing to invoice you at the completion of the transcript.  There will be 
less fees involved on my end if you are intending to pay via ACH if I invoice you only one time.
 

From: Paul Dulberg [mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net] 
Sent: Monday, April 5, 2021 10:47 AM
To: Stacey Collins <SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 17 LA 377
 
Dear Stacy Collins,
 
Sorry I didn't realize it was a holiday last Friday until after I sent that email.
 
Please send an invoice that allows me to pay via bank ACH so you have the necessary deposit to 
start work the transcript.
 
Thank you,
Paul
 
Paul Dulberg
847-497-4250
4606 Hayden Ct.
McHenry, IL 60051

On Apr 5, 2021, at 8:47 AM, Stacey Collins 
<SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov> wrote:
 
send you an invoice that allows you to pay via bank ACH

 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the County network. Do not click 
links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is 

safe. 

While mismatches between the actual SENDER field and the FROM field are 
common. It is also a common spoofing tactic. For additional reference, this email was 

actually sent from pdulberg@comcast.net

mailto:SACollins@22ndcircuit.illinoiscourts.gov
mailto:pdulberg@comcast.net


If you have any questions about the legitimacy of this email, please call the helpdesk 
at extension 4828.

 


